Adnan Khan

From: airbalance@rogers.com

Sent: Monday, June 16, 2025 2:56 PM

To: Adnan Khan

Cc: Inzaman Khan

Subject: RE: SDM 830 Fairview Mall: Request for TAB quote

I External (airbalance@rogers.com)
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Adnan,

Air balancing quotation; $ 800. + hst

Thanks,

Henry Sapa, P.Eng.

Air Balance Group Inc.
204 Ridgewood Road
Toronto ON M1C 2X2

tel. 416-417-2718

Email: airbalance@rogers.com
Website: www.airbalancegroup.com

From: Adnan Khan <adnan@consultmechanical.com>
Sent: June 16, 2025 2:26 PM

To: Henryk Sapa <airbalance@rogers.com>

Cc: Inzaman Khan <inzaman@consultmechanical.com>
Subject: SDM 830 Fairview Mall: Request for TAB quote

Hi Henry,
Canyou please provide us the quote for the TAB works for the attached project.

Thanks.

Adnan Khan

Project Manager
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905-738-1400

adnan@consultmechanical.com

https://consultmechanical.com/

Unit-2, 54 Audia Ct, Concord, ON L4K 3N5



